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ISKUL SAMA DILAUT OMADAL

To build young leaders among the local community

(Malaysian citizen and stateless) through holistic education

Iskul E-News Issue 8 || Nov 2022

Dear <<First Name>> , 

We apologise for the long silence, however, rest assured that we haven’t
been idle. 

The past two years have been busy, busy, busy, for Iskul Sama Dilaut Omadal.
From providing aid during Covid-19 lockdowns to hosting a monthly ‘Pesta
Bulan Paluwak’ festival, Iskul has been engaging the community of Omadal in
various interesting and sustainable ways. 
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Although 2020 was a tough year for us all, it was even tougher for the
community in Omadal who, before Covid-19, were already living day-by-day.
Iskul became a homebase to the students and their families as well as the rest
of the   communities in Omadal, both stateless and otherwise.  Our work was
recognised when we received the Yayasan Hasanah Special Grant in 2020
(YSGH 2020). It sustained our operations from July 2020 to September 2021.
Moreover, it also enabled us to initiate social development projects for the
community.
 

In 2021, on top of providing basic literacy classes and nutritious meals to our
students, we also kick-started two social development projects. These projects
centred around community healthcare in two aspects. First, was a community
water project where we provided improved water access for hygiene education
and practices which was critical in view of the Covid-19 pandemic. Second, we
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provided nutrition by way of supplements to increase maternity and children’s
health. These two milestones reinforced our holistic approach to education.
Students can achieve their academic potential when they and their families are
healthy and secure. This program was mainly funded by the Yayasan Hasanah
Special Grant (YHSG 2020).

We have been busy this year too! On top of our regular classes, we have
launched a new Marine Stewardship Module in collaboration with marine
experts from Reef Check Malaysia. We also initiated a Life Science Program,
Content Creator Program and Waste Management Pilot Project funded by the
UNDP Small Grant Project. The content creator program trains 10 youth, both
stateless and Malaysian, to tell stories of Omadal to the wider community
through video productions uploaded to Iskul’s YouTube. More updates on 2022
will be coming your way soon in the next e-newsletter!

Iskul Is On YouTube!

Watch our students perform “wayang kulit” in their mother tongue to share about the
danger of Covid-19 with their community in our YouTube channel.

Help us become a YouTube Partner so our youth can earn extra income
through the videos they create.

Download Iskul 2020-2021 full progress report here

Follow Iskul's Facebook page to keep posted!

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=wx75mPSCys8
http://iskul.my/wp-content/uploads/Donors-Iskul-Progress-Report-for-2020-2022-3.pdf
https://www.facebook.com/iskulsamadilautomadal
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We’re only 500 watch hours away from this dream! 

To see a usual day in Iskul, watch the video below.

We at Iskul thank you for your time and support. Magsukul!

With gratitude,
Iskul Team.
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